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1:30 p.m. 
 

PRAYERS 
 

PRESENTING PETITIONS 
 
Petitions of citizens of the Province of Saskatchewan were presented and laid upon the Table by the 
following Members: Draude, Harpauer, Brkich, Weekes and Morgan. 

 
 

READING AND RECEIVING PETITIONS 
 
According to Order, the Deputy Clerk having favourably reported on the same pursuant to Rule 14(7), the 
following Petitions were read and received: 
 

Of citizens of the Province of Saskatchewan humbly praying that your Honourable Assembly may be 
pleased to cause the Government to take the necessary action to ensure that a portion of the province’s 
windfall oil revenue be used to reduce the provincial gas tax. 

(Sessional Paper No. 13) 
 

Of citizens of the Province of Saskatchewan humbly praying that your Honourable Assembly may be 
pleased to cause the Government to take immediate action and make necessary repairs to the Highway 
321 in order to address safety and economic concerns. 

(Addendum to Sessional Paper No. 2) 
 

Of citizens of the Province of Saskatchewan humbly praying that your Honourable Assembly may be 
pleased to cause the Government to ensure that the Biggar Hospital, Long-term Care Home and 
Ambulance services, maintain, at the very least, their current level of services. 

(Addendum to Sessional Paper No. 5) 
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Of citizens of the Province of Saskatchewan humbly praying that your Honourable Assembly may be 
pleased to cause the Government to take all necessary action to upgrade and widen Highway 5 from 
Humboldt to Saskatoon. 

(Addendum to Sessional Paper No. 7) 
 

Of citizens of the Province of Saskatchewan humbly praying that your Honourable Assembly may be 
pleased to cause the Government to repair Highway 310 in order to address safety concerns and to 
facilitate economic growth and tourism in Foam Lake, Fishing Lake, Kuroki and surrounding areas. 

(Addendum to Sessional Paper No. 8) 
 

INTRODUCTION OF BILLS 
 
The following Bills were received, read the first time, and ordered to be read a second time at the next 
sitting: 
 
 Bill No. 11 - The Youth Justice Administration Amendment Act, 2005 

(Hon. Mr. Prebble) 
 
 Bill No. 13 – The Archives Amendment Act, 2005 

(Hon. Ms. Beatty) 
 
 Bill No. 14 – The Provincial Emblems and Honours Amendment Act, 2005 

(Hon. Ms. Beatty) 
 

SPEAKER TABLES REPORT 
 
The Speaker laid before the Assembly a Message from Her Honour the Lieutenant Governor communicating 
the membership of the Board of Internal Economy, dated November 10, 2005. 

(Sessional Paper No. 20) 
 

MOTION PURSUANT TO RULE 49 
 

Leave of the Assembly having been granted, pursuant to Rule 49, it was moved by Mr. Bjornerud, seconded 
by Mr. Dearborn: 
 

That this Assembly condemn the federal government for completely ignoring the current agriculture 
crisis in its November 14, 2005 economic update; and 
 
That this Assembly condemn the provincial government for its failure to raise the importance of the 
current agriculture crisis with the federal government. 
 

A debate arising, it was moved by the Hon. Mr. Wartman, seconded by the Hon. Mr. Serby, in amendment 
thereto: 
 

That all the words after the word “update” be deleted and the following added, thereto: 
 

and that this Assembly condemn the federal government for its failure to fulfill its commitment to 
negotiate an Energy Accord for the people of Saskatchewan. 

 
The debate continuing on the motion and the amendment, the Assembly recessed from 5:00 to 7:00 p.m. 
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The debate being resumed on the motion and the amendment and the question being put on the amendment, 
it was agreed to on division. 
 
The question being put on the motion as amended, it was agreed to. 
 
 

ADDRESS IN REPLY 
 

The Assembly resumed the adjourned debate on the proposed motion of Ms. Junor, seconded by Mr. Harper: 
 
That an Humble Address be presented to Her Honour the Lieutenant Governor as follows: 
 
TO HER HONOUR THE HONOURABLE LYNDA M. HAVERSTOCK 
Lieutenant Governor of the Province of Saskatchewan 
 
MAY IT PLEASE YOUR HONOUR: 
 
We, Her Majesty’s dutiful and loyal subjects, the Legislative Assembly of the Province of Saskatchewan, in 
Session assembled, humbly thank Your Honour for the gracious Speech which Your Honour has been 
pleased to address to us at the opening of the present Session. 
 
and the proposed amendment thereto moved by Mr. Wall, seconded by Mr. Dearborn: 
 

That the following words be added after the word “Session”: 
 

However, this government no longer enjoys the confidence of the Assembly because of its lack of 
vision and initiative and its failure to address the issues that are most important to Saskatchewan 
people as demonstrated by ignoring the crisis in agriculture, the inability to set spending priorities 
consistent with the province’s needs, the failure to grow the economy and create economic 
prosperity, by not delivering much needed services leaving many people behind, by forcing others to 
move out of the province for health care and by forcing people to pursue their careers and dreams 
elsewhere because they cannot find jobs in Saskatchewan. 

 
The debate continuing on the motion and the amendment, it was on motion of Ms. Hamilton, adjourned. 
 
 
 
 
On motion of the Hon. Mr. Taylor: 
 
Ordered, That this Assembly do now adjourn. 
 

–––––––––––––––––––– 
 

The Assembly adjourned at 10:05 p.m. until Wednesday at 1:30 p.m. 
 
 
  Hon. P. Myron Kowalsky  
  Speaker 
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RETURNS, REPORTS AND PAPERS TABLED 
 

By the Hon. Mr. Quennell: 
 
Amendments to the Bylaws of the following Professional Associations: 
 Saskatchewan College of Pharmacists 
 Saskatchewan Society of Medical Laboratory Technologists 
 Law Society of Saskatchewan 

(Addendum Sessional Paper No. 11) 
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NOTICE OF MOTIONS FOR FIRST READING OF BILLS 
 
On Thursday: 
 
Hon. Mr. Prebble to move First Reading of Bill No. 21 – The Boiler and Pressure Vessel Amendment 
Act, 2005 
 
Hon. Mr. Forbes to move First Reading of Bill No. 22 – The Forestry Professions Act 
 
Hon. Mr. Van Mulligen to move First Reading of Bill No. 23 – The Corporation Capital Tax Amendment 
Act, 2005 (No. 2) 
 
Mr. Hermanson to move First Reading of Bill No. 202 – The Legislative Assembly and Executive 
Council (Set Election Dates) Amendment Act, 2005 
 
 
NOTICE OF WRITTEN QUESTIONS 
 
The following Questions were given notice on day no. 3 and are to be answered by day no. 8: 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 170: 
 
To the Minister of Northern Affairs: (1) For the fiscal year 2004/05, did management of the department 
establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? (2) How did 
management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 171: 
 
To the Minister of Northern Affairs: (1) For the fiscal year 2003/04, was management of the department 
aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, for example, information 
received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, what was 
the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 172: 
 
To the Minister of Northern Affairs: (1) For the fiscal year 2003/04, did management of the department 
have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the department? (2) If 
so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 173: 
 
To the Minister of Northern Affairs: For the fiscal year, 2003/04, what did the department find as a result 
of the establishment of programs and control to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud in 
the department? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 174: 
 
To the Minister of Northern Affairs: (1) For the fiscal year 2004/05, was management of the department 
aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, for example, information 
received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, what was 
the nature of this activity? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 175: 
 
To the Minister of Industry and Resources: (1) For 2003/04, was management of the department/Crown 
aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, for example, information 
received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, what was 
the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 176: 
 
To the Minister of Northern Affairs: (1) For the fiscal year 2004/05, did management of the department 
have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the department? (2) If 
so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 177: 
 
To the Minister of Northern Affairs: For the fiscal year 2004/05, what did the department find as a result 
of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud in 
the department? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 178: 
 
To the Minister of Northern Affairs: (1) For the fiscal year 2005/06, has management of the department 
had any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the department? (2) If 
so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 179: 
 
To the Minister of Northern Affairs: For the fiscal year 2005/06, what has the department found as a 
result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect 
fraud in the department? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 180: 
 
To the Minister of Northern Affairs: (1) For the fiscal year 2003/04, did management of the department 
establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? (2) How did 
management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 181: 
 
To the Minister of Industry and Resources: (1) For the current year, is management of the 
department/Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the 
department/Crown, such as information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, 
suppliers or others? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 182: 
 
To the Minister of Northern Affairs: (1) For the fiscal year 2005/06, was management of the department 
aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, for example, information 
received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, what was 
the nature of this activity? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 183: 
 
To the Minister of Immigration: (1) For the fiscal year 2004/05, did management of the department 
establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? (2) How did 
management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 184: 
 
To the Minister of Immigration: (1) For the fiscal year 2003/04, was management of the department 
aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, for example, information 
received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, what was 
the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 185: 
 
To the Minister of Immigration: (1) For the fiscal year 2003/04, did management of the department have 
any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the department? (2) If so, 
what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 186: 
 
To the Minister of Immigration: For the fiscal year 2003/04, what did the department find as a result of 
the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud in the 
department? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 187: 
 
To the Minister of Immigration: (1) For the fiscal year 2004/05, was management of the department 
aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, for example, information 
received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, what was 
the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 188: 
 
To the Minister of Immigration: (1) For the fiscal year 2004/05, did management of the department have 
any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the department? (2) If so, 
what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 189: 
 
To the Minister of Immigration: For the fiscal year 2004/05, what did the department find as a result of 
the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud in the 
department? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 190: 
 
To the Minister of Immigration: (1) For the fiscal year 2005/06, has management of the department had 
any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the department? (2) If so, 
what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 191: 
 
To the Minister of Immigration: For the fiscal year 2005/06, what has the department found as a result of 
the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud in the 
department? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 192: 
 
To the Minister of Immigration: (1) For the fiscal year 2005/06, has management of the department 
established programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? (2) How has 
management monitored the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 193: 
 
To the Minister of Immigration: (1) For the fiscal year 2003/04, did management of the department 
establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? (2) How did 
management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 194: 
 
To the Minister of Immigration: (1) For the fiscal year 2005/06, was management of the department 
aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, for example, information 
received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, what was 
the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 195: 
 
To the Minister of Government Relations: (1) For the fiscal year 2003/04, did management of the 
department establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? (2) 
How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 196: 
 
To the Minister of Government Relations: (1) For the fiscal year 2004/05, did management of the 
department establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? (2) 
How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 197: 
 
To the Minister of Government Relations: (1) For the fiscal year 2003/04, was management of the 
department aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, for example, 
information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, 
what was the nature of this activity? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 198: 
 
To the Minister of Government Relations: (1) For the fiscal year 2003/04, did management of the 
department have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the 
department? (2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 199: 
 
To the Minister of Government Relations: For the fiscal year 2003/04, what did the department find as a 
result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect 
fraud in the department? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 200: 
 
To the Minister of Government Relations: (1) For the fiscal year 2004/05, was management of the 
department aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, for example, 
information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, 
what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 201: 
 
To the Minister of Government Relations: (1) For the fiscal year 2004/05, did management of the 
department have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the 
department? (2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 202: 
 
To the Minister of Government Relations: For the fiscal year 2004/05, what did the department find as a 
result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect 
fraud in the department? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 203: 
 
To the Minister of Government Relations: (1) For the fiscal year 2005/06, has management of the 
department had any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the 
department? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 204: 
 
To the Minister of Government Relations: For the fiscal year 2005/06, what has the department found as a 
result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect 
fraud in the department? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 205: 
 
To the Minister of Government Relations: (1) For the fiscal year 2005/06, has management of the 
department established programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? 
(2) How has management monitored the above programs and/or controls? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 206: 
 
To the Minister of Government Relations: (1) For the fiscal year 2005/06, was management of the 
department aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, for example, 
information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, 
what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 207: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: (1) For the fiscal year 2004/05, did management of the 
department establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? (2) 
How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 208: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: (1) For the fiscal year 2003/04, was management of the 
department aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, for example, 
information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, 
what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 209: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: (1) For the fiscal year 2003/04, did management of the 
department have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the 
department? (2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 210: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: For the fiscal year 2003/04, what did the department 
find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud in the department? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 211: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: (1) For the fiscal year 2004/05, was management of the 
department aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, for example, 
information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, 
what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 212: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: (1) For the fiscal year 2004/05, did management of the 
department have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the 
department? (2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 213: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: For the fiscal year 2004/05, what did the department 
find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud in the department? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 214: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: (1) For the fiscal year 2005/06, has management of the 
department had any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the 
department? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 215: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: For the fiscal year 2005/06, what has the department 
found as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent 
or detect fraud in the department? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 216: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: (1) For the fiscal year 2005/06, has management of the 
department established programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? 
(2) How has management monitored the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 217: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: (1) For the fiscal year 2003/04, did management of the 
department establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? (2) 
How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 218: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: (1) For the fiscal year 2005/06, was management of the 
department aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, for example, 
information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, 
what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 219: 
 
To the Minister of First Nations and Métis Relations: (1) For the fiscal year 2004/05, did management of 
the department establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? 
(2) How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 220: 
 
To the Minister of First Nations and Métis Relations: (1) For the fiscal year 2003/04, was management of 
the department aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, for 
example, information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? 
(2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 221: 
 
To the Minister of First Nations and Métis Relations: (1) For the fiscal year 2003/04, did management of 
the department have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the 
department? (2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 222: 
 
To the Minister of First Nations and Métis Relations: For the fiscal year 2003/04, what did the department 
find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud in the department? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 223: 
 
To the Minister of First Nations and Métis Relations: (1) For the fiscal year 2004/05, was management of 
the department aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, for 
example, information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? 
(2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 224: 
 
To the Minister of First Nations and Métis Relations: (1) For the fiscal year 2004/05, did management of 
the department have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the 
department? (2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 225: 
 
To the Minister of First Nations and Métis Relations: For the fiscal year 2004/05, what did the department 
find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud in the department? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 226: 
 
To the Minister of First Nations and Métis Relations: (1) For the fiscal year 2005/06, has management of 
the department had any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the 
department? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 227: 
 
To the Minister of First Nations and Métis Relations: For the fiscal year 2005/06, what has the 
department found as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to 
help prevent or detect fraud in the department? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 228: 
 
To the Minister of First Nations and Métis Relations: (1) For the fiscal year 2005/06, has management of 
the department established programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect 
fraud? (2) How has management monitored the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 229: 
 
To the Minister of First Nations and Métis Relations: (1) For the fiscal year 2003/04, did management of 
the department establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? 
(2) How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 230: 
 
To the Minister of First Nations and Métis Relations: (1) For the fiscal year 2005/06, was management of 
the department aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, for 
example, information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? 
(2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 231: 
 
To the Minister of Finance: For the current year, how does management monitor fraud programs and/or 
controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 232: 
 
To the Minister of Finance: For 2004/05, how did management monitor fraud programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 233: 
 
To the Minister of Finance: For 2003/04, how did management monitor fraud programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 234: 
 
To the Minister of Finance: For 2003/04, had management of the department/Crown established programs 
and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 235: 
 
To the Minister of Finance: For 2004/05, had management of the department/Crown established programs 
and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 236: 
 
To the Minister of Finance: For the current year, has management of the department/Crown established 
programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 237: 
 
To the Minister of Finance: (1) For 2003/04, did management of the department/Crown have any 
knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the department/Crown? (2) If 
so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 238: 
 
To the Minister of Finance: (1) For 2004/05, did management of the department/Crown have any 
knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the department/Crown? (2) If 
so, what is the nature of this activity? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 239: 
 
To the Minister of Finance: (1) For the current year, does management of the department/Crown have any 
knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the department/Crown? (2) If 
so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 240: 
 
To the Minister of Finance: (1) For the current year, is management of the department/Crown aware of 
any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department/Crown, for example, information 
received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, what is the 
nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 241: 
 
To the Minister of Finance: (1) For 2003/04, was management of the department/Crown aware of any 
allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department/Crown, for example, information 
received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, what is the 
nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 242: 
 
To the Minister of Finance: (1) For 2004/05, was management of the department/Crown aware of any 
allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department/Crown, for example, information 
received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, what is the 
nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 243: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for the Saskatchewan Crop Insurance Corporation: For 2004/05, how did 
management monitor fraud programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 244: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for the Saskatchewan Crop Insurance Corporation: For 2003/04, how did 
management monitor fraud programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 245: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for the Saskatchewan Crop Insurance Corporation: For 2003/04, had 
management of the department/Crown established programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help 
prevent or detect fraud? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 246: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for the Saskatchewan Crop Insurance Corporation: For 2004/05, had 
management of the department/Crown established programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help 
prevent or detect fraud? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 247: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for the Saskatchewan Crop Insurance Corporation: For the current year, has 
management of the department/Crown established programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help 
prevent or detect fraud? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 248: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for the Saskatchewan Crop Insurance Corporation: (1) For 2003/04, did 
management of the department/Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other 
illegal activity within the department/Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 249: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for the Saskatchewan Crop Insurance Corporation: (1) For 2004/05, did 
management of the department/Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other 
illegal activity within the department/Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 250: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for the Saskatchewan Crop Insurance Corporation: (1) For the current year, 
does management of the department/Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other 
illegal activity within the department/Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 251: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for the Saskatchewan Crop Insurance Corporation: (1) For the current year, 
is management of the department/Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within 
the department/Crown, for example, information received from employees, former employees, 
customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 252: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for the Saskatchewan Crop Insurance Corporation: (1) For 2003/04, was 
management of the department/Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the 
department/Crown, for example, information received from employees, former employees, 
customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 253: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for the Saskatchewan Crop Insurance Corporation: (1) For 2004/05, was 
management of the department/Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the 
department/Crown, for example, information received from employees, former employees, 
customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 254: 
 
To the Minister of Community Resources and Employment: (1) Is management of the department aware 
of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department from April 1, 2005 to the 
present, for example, information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, 
suppliers or others? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 255: 
 
To the Minister of Community Resources and Employment: (1) Does management of the department 
have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity from April 1, 2005 to the 
present within the department ? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 256: 
 
To the Minister of Community Resources and Employment: (1) Has management of the department 
established programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud from April 1, 
2005 to the present? (2) How has management monitored the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 257: 
 
To the Minister of Community Resources and Employment: From April 1, 2005 to the present, what has 
the department found as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to 
help prevent or detect fraud in the department? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 258: 
 
To the Minister of Community Resources and Employment: (1) For the year 2004/05, was management 
of the department aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, for 
example, information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? 
(2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 259: 
 
To the Minister of Community Resources and Employment: For the year 2004/05, what did the 
department find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help 
prevent or detect fraud in the department? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 260: 
 
To the Minister of Community Resources and Employment: (1) For 2004/05, did management of the 
department/Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within 
the department/Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 261: 
 
To the Minister of Community Resources and Employment: (1) For the fiscal year 2004/05, did 
management of the department establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent 
or detect fraud? (2) How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 262: 
 
To the Minister of Community Resources and Employment: For the fiscal year 2003/04, what did the 
department find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help 
prevent or detect fraud in the department? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 263: 
 
To the Minister of Community Resources and Employment: (1) For 2003/04, did management of the 
department/Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within 
the department/Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 264: 
 
To the Minister of Community Resources and Employment: (1) For 2003/04, was management of the 
department aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, for example, 
information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, 
what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 265: 
 
To the Minister of Community Resources and Employment: (1) For the year 2003/04, did management of 
the department establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? 
(2) How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 266: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority: (1) For the year 2003, did 
management of the Crown establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud? (2) How did management monitored the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 267: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority: For the year 2003, what 
did the Crown find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to 
help prevent or detect fraud in the Crown?  
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 268: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority: (1) For the year 2003, did 
management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity 
within the Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 269: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority: (1) For the year 2003, was 
management of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, for 
example, information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? 
(2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 270: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Crown Investments Corporation: (1) For the year 2003, did management 
of the Crown establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? 
(2) How did management monitored the above programs and/or controls? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 271: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Crown Investments Corporation: For the year 2003, what did the Crown 
find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud in the Crown?  
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 272: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Crown Investments Corporation: (1) For the year 2003, did management 
of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the 
Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 273: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Crown Investments Corporation: (1) For the year 2003, was management 
of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, for example, 
information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, 
what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 274: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Telecommunications Corporation: (1) For the year 2003, 
did management of the Crown establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent 
or detect fraud? (2) How did management monitored the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 275: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Telecommunications Corporation: For the year 2003, what 
did the Crown find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to 
help prevent or detect fraud in the Crown?  
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 276: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Telecommunications Corporation: (1) For the year 2003, 
did management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal 
activity within the Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 277: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Telecommunications Corporation: (1) For the year 2003, 
was management of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the 
Crown, for example, information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, 
suppliers or others? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 278: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Power Corporation: (1) For the year 2003, did 
management of the department establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent 
or detect fraud? (2) How did management monitored the above programs and/or controls? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 279: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Power Corporation: For the year 2003, what did the 
Crown find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud or to help prevent 
fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 280: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Power Corporation: (1) For the year 2003, did 
management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity 
within the Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 281: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Power Corporation: (1) For the year 2003, was 
management of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, for 
example, information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? 
(2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 282: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for SaskEnergy Incorporated: (1) For the year 2003, did management of the 
Crown establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? (2) How 
did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 283: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for SaskEnergy Incorporated: For the year 2003, what did the Crown find as 
a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect 
fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 284: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for SaskEnergy Incorporated: (1) For the year 2003, did management of the 
Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown? 
(2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 285: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for SaskEnergy Incorporated: (1) For the year 2003, was management of the 
Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, such as information 
received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, what was 
the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 286: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Property Management Corporation: (1) For the year 2004, 
did management of the Crown establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent 
or detect fraud? (2) How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 287: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Property Management Corporation: For the year 2004, 
what did the Crown find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks 
or to help prevent or detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 288: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Property Management Corporation: (1) For the year 2004, 
did management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal 
activity within the Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 289: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Property Management Corporation: (1) For the year 2004, 
was management of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the 
Crown, such as information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or 
others? (2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 290: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Water Corporation: (1) For the year 2004, did 
management of the Crown establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud? (2) How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 291: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Water Corporation: For the year 2004, what did the Crown 
find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 292: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Water Corporation: (1) For the year 2004, did 
management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity 
within the Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 293: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Water Corporation: (1) For the year 2004, was 
management of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, 
such as information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? 
(2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 294: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Investment Saskatchewan: (1) For the year 2004, did management of the 
Crown establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? (2) How 
did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 295: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Investment Saskatchewan: For the year 2004, what did the Crown find as 
a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect 
fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 296: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Investment Saskatchewan: (1) For the year 2004, did management of the 
Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown? 
(2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 297: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Investment Saskatchewan: (1) For the year 2004, was management of the 
Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, such as information 
received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, what was 
the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 298: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Transportation Company: (1) For the year 2004, did 
management of the Crown establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud? (2) How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 299: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Transportation Company: For the year 2004, what did the 
Crown find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help 
prevent or detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 300: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Transportation Company: (1) For the year 2004, did 
management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity 
within the Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 301: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Transportation Company: (1) For the year 2004, was 
management of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, 
such as information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? 
(2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 302: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Government Insurance: (1) For the year 2004, did 
management of the Crown establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud? (2) How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 303: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Government Insurance: For the year 2004, what did the 
Crown find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help 
prevent or detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 304: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Government Insurance: (1) For the year 2004, did 
management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity 
within the Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 305: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Government Insurance: (1) For the year 2004, was 
management of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, 
such as information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? 
(2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 306: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Gaming Corporation: (1) For the year 2004, did 
management of the Crown establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud? (2) How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 307: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Gaming Corporation: For the year 2004, what did the 
Crown find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help 
prevent or detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 308: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Gaming Corporation: (1) For the year 2004, did 
management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity 
within the Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 309: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Gaming Corporation: (1) For the year 2004, was 
management of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, 
such as information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? 
(2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 310: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Investment Saskatchewan: (1) For the year 2003, did management of the 
Crown establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? (2) How 
did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 311: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Investment Saskatchewan: For the year 2003, what did the Crown find as 
a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect 
fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 312: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Investment Saskatchewan: (1) For the year 2003, did management of the 
Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown? 
(2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 313: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Investment Saskatchewan: (1) For the year 2003, was management of the 
Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, such as information 
received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, what was 
the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 314: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Water Corporation: (1) For the year 2003, did 
management of the Crown establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud? (2) How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 315: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Water Corporation: For the year 2003, what did the Crown 
find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 316: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Water Corporation: (1) For the year 2003, did 
management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity 
within the Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 317: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Water Corporation: (1) For the year 2003, was 
management of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, 
such as information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? 
(2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 318: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Property Management Corporation: (1) For the year 2003, 
did management of the Crown establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent 
or detect fraud? (2) How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 319: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Property Management Corporation: For the year 2003, 
what did the Crown find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks 
or to help prevent or detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 320: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Property Management Corporation: (1) For the year 2003, 
did management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal 
activity within the Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 321: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Property Management Corporation: (1) For the year 2003, 
was management of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the 
Crown, such as information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or 
others? (2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 322: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Gaming Corporation: (1) For the year 2003, did 
management of the Crown establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud? (2) How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 323: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Gaming Corporation: For the year 2003, what did the 
Crown find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help 
prevent or detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 324:  
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Gaming Corporation: (1) For the year 2003, did 
management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity 
within the Crown? (2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 325:  
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Gaming Corporation: (1) For the year 2003, was 
management of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, 
such as information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? 
(2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 326:  
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority: (1) For the year 2005, has 
management of the Crown established programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud? (2) How has management monitored the above programs and/or controls? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 327:  
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority: For the year 2005, what 
did the Crown find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to 
help prevent or detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 328:  
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority: (1) For the year 2005, does 
management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity 
within the Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 329:  
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority: (1) For the year 2005, is 
management of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, 
such as information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? 
(2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 330:  
 
To the Minister Responsible for Crown Investments Corporation: (1) For the year 2005, has management 
of the Crown established programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? 
(2) How has management monitored the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 331:  
 
To the Minister Responsible for Crown Investments Corporation: For the year 2005, what did the Crown 
find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 332:  
 
To the Minister Responsible for Crown Investments Corporation: (1) For the year 2005, does 
management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity 
within the Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 333:  
 
To the Minister Responsible for Crown Investments Corporation: (1) For the year 2005, is management 
of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, such as 
information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, 
what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 334:  
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Telecommunications Corporation: (1) For the year 2005, 
has management of the Crown established programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent 
or detect fraud? (2) How has management monitored the above programs and/or controls? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 335:  
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Telecommunications Corporation: For the year 2005, what 
did the Crown find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to 
help prevent or detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 336:  
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Telecommunications Corporation: (1) For the year 2005, 
does management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal 
activity within the Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 337:  
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Telecommunications Corporation: (1) For the year 2005, 
is management of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, 
such as information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? 
(2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 338:  
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Power Corporation: (1) For the year 2005, has 
management of the Crown established programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud? (2) How has management monitored the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 339:  
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Power Corporation: For the year 2005, what did the 
Crown find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help 
prevent or detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 340:  
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Power Corporation: (1) For the year 2005, does 
management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity 
within the Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 341: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Power Corporation: (1) For the year 2005, is management 
of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, such as 
information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, 
what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 342: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for SaskEnergy Incorporated: (1) For the year 2004, did management of the 
Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown? 
(2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 343: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for SaskEnergy Incorporated: For the year 2004, what did the Crown find as 
a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect 
fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 344: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for SaskEnergy Incorporated: (1) For the year 2004, did management of the 
Crown establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? (2) How 
did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 345: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for SaskEnergy Incorporated: (1) For the year 2004, was management of the 
Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, such as information 
received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, what was 
the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 346: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Power Corporation: (1) For the year 2004, did 
management of the Crown establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud? (2) How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 347: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Power Corporation: For the year 2004, what did the 
Crown find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help 
prevent or detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 348: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Power Corporation: (1) For the year 2004, did 
management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity 
within the Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 349: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Power Corporation: (1) For the year 2004, was 
management of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, 
such as information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? 
(2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 350: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Telecommunications Corporation: (1) For the year 2004, 
did management of the Crown establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent 
or detect fraud? (2) How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 351: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Telecommunications Corporation: For the year 2004, what 
did the Crown find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to 
help prevent or detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 352: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Telecommunications Corporation: (1) For the year 2004, 
did management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal 
activity within the Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 353: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Telecommunications Corporation: (1) For the year 2004, 
was management of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the 
Crown, such as information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or 
others? (2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 354: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Crown Investments Corporation: (1) For the year 2004, did management 
of the Crown establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? 
(2) How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 355: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Crown Investments Corporation: For the year 2004, what did the Crown 
find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 356: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Crown Investments Corporation: (1) For the year 2004, did management 
of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the 
Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 357: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Crown Investments Corporation: (1) For the year 2004, was management 
of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, such as 
information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, 
what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 358: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority: (1) For the year 2004, did 
management of the Crown establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud? (2) How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 359: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority: For the year 2004, what 
did the Crown find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to 
help prevent or detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 360: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority: (1) For the year 2004, did 
management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity 
within the Crown? (2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 361: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority: (1) For the year 2004, was 
management of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, 
such as information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? 
(2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 362: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Government Insurance: For the year 2003, what did the 
Crown find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help 
prevent or detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 363: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Government Insurance: (1) For the year 2003, did 
management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity 
within the Crown? (2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 364: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Government Insurance: (1) For the year 2003, did 
management of the Crown establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud? (2) How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 365: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Government Insurance: (1) For the year 2003, was 
management of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, 
such as information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? 
(2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 366: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Transportation Company: (1) For the year 2003, did 
management of the Crown establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud? (2) How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 367: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Transportation Company: For the year 2003, what did the 
Crown find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help 
prevent or detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 368: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Transportation Company: (1) For the year 2003, did 
management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity 
within the Crown? (2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 369: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Transportation Company: (1) For the year 2003, was 
management of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, 
such as information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? 
(2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 370: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for SaskEnergy Incorporated: (1) For the year 2005, has management of the 
Crown established programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? (2) 
How has management monitored the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 371: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for SaskEnergy Incorporated: For the year 2005, what has the Crown found 
as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 372: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for SaskEnergy Incorporated: (1) For the year 2005, does management of the 
Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown? 
(2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 373: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for SaskEnergy Incorporated: (1) For the year 2005, is management of the 
Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, such as information 
received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, what is the 
nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 374: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Government Insurance: (1) For the year 2005, has 
management of the Crown established programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud? (2) How has management monitored the above programs and/or controls? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 375: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Government Insurance: For the year 2005, what has the 
Crown found as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help 
prevent or detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 376: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Government Insurance: (1) For the year 2005, does 
management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity 
within the Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 377: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Government Insurance: (1) For the year 2005, is 
management of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, 
such as information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? 
(2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 378: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Transportation Company: (1) For the year 2005, has 
management of the Crown established programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud? (2) How has management monitored the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 379: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Transportation Company: For the year 2005, what has the 
Crown found as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help 
prevent or detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 380: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Transportation Company: (1) For the year 2005, does 
management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity 
within the Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 381: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Transportation Company: (1) For the year 2005, is 
management of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, 
such as information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? 
(2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 382: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Investment Saskatchewan: (1) For the year 2005, has management of the 
Crown established programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? (2) 
How has management monitored the above programs and/or controls? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 383: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Investment Saskatchewan: For the year 2005, what has the Crown found 
as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 384: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Investment Saskatchewan: (1) For the year 2005, does management of 
the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the 
Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 385: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Investment Saskatchewan: (1) For the year 2005, is management of the 
Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, such as information 
received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, what is the 
nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 386: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Water Corporation: (1) For the year 2005, has 
management of the Crown established programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud? (2) How has management monitored the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 387: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Water Corporation: For the year 2005, what has the 
Crown found as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help 
prevent or detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 388: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Water Corporation: (1) For the year 2005, does 
management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity 
within the Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 389: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Water Corporation: (1) For the year 2005, is management 
of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, such as 
information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, 
what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 390: 
 
To the Minister of Property Management: (1) For the year 2005, has management of the department 
established programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? (2) How has 
management monitored the above programs and/or controls? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 391: 
 
To the Minister of Property Management: For the year 2005, what has the department found as a result of 
the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud in the 
department? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 392: 
 
To the Minister of Property Management: (1) For the year 2005, does management of the department 
have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the department? (2) If 
so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 393: 
 
To the Minister of Property Management: (1) For the year 2005, is management of the department aware 
of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, such as information received 
from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, what is the nature of 
this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 394: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Gaming Corporation: (1) For the year 2005, has 
management of the Crown established programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud? (2) How has management monitored the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 395: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Gaming Corporation: For the year 2005, what has the 
Crown found as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help 
prevent or detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 396: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Gaming Corporation: (1) For the year 2005, does 
management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity 
within the Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 397: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Saskatchewan Gaming Corporation: (1) For the year 2005, is 
management of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, 
such as information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? 
(2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 398: 
 
To the Minister of Corrections and Public Safety: (1) Is management of the department aware of any 
allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department from April 1, 2005 to the present, such 
as information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If 
so, what is the nature of this activity? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 399: 
 
To the Minister of Corrections and Public Safety: (1) Does management of the department have any 
knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity from April 1, 2005 to the present 
within the department? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 400: 
 
To the Minister of Corrections and Public Safety: From April 1, 2005 to the present, what has the 
department found as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to 
help prevent or detect fraud in the department? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 401: 
 
To the Minister of Corrections and Public Safety: (1) Has management of the department established 
programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud from April 1, 2005 to the 
present? (2) How has management monitored the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 402: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Public Service Commission: (1) For the year 2004, did management of 
the commission establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? 
(2) How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 403: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Public Service Commission: For the year 2004, what did the commission 
find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud in the commission? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 404: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Public Service Commission: (1) For the year 2004, did management of 
the commission have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the 
commission? (2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 405: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Public Service Commission: (1) For the year 2004, was management of 
the commission aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the commission, such as 
information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, 
what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 406: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Information Services Corporation: (1) For the year 2004, did 
management of the Crown establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud? (2) How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 407: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Information Services Corporation: For the year 2004, what did the 
Crown find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help 
prevent or detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 408: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Information Services Corporation: (1) For the year 2004, did 
management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity 
within the Crown? (2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 409: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Information Services Corporation: (1) For the year 2004, was 
management of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, 
such as information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? 
(2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 410: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Information Services Corporation: (1) For the year 2003, did 
management of the Crown establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud? (2) How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 411: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Information Services Corporation: For the year 2003, what did the 
Crown find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help 
prevent or detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 412: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Information Services Corporation: (1) For the year 2003, did 
management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity 
within the Crown? (2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 413: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Information Services Corporation: (1) For the year 2003, was 
management of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, 
such as information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? 
(2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 414: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Public Service Commission: (1) For the year 2003, did management of 
the commission establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? 
(2) How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 415: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Public Service Commission: For the year 2003, what did the commission 
find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud in the commission? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 416: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Public Service Commission: (1) For the year 2003, did management of 
the commission have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the 
commission? (2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 417: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Public Service Commission: (1) For the year 2003, was management of 
the commission aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the commission, such as 
information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, 
what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 418: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Public Service Commission: (1) For the year 2005, has management of 
the commission established programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect 
fraud? (2) How has management monitored the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 419: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Public Service Commission: For the year 2005, what did the commission 
find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud in the commission? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 420: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Public Service Commission: (1) For the year 2005, does management of 
the commission have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the 
commission? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 421: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Public Service Commission: (1) For the year 2005, is management of the 
commission aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the commission, such as 
information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, 
what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 422: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Information Services Corporation: (1) For the year 2005, has 
management of the Crown established programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud? (2) How has management monitored the above programs and/or controls? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 423: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Information Services Corporation: For the year 2005, what did the 
Crown find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help 
prevent or detect fraud in the Crown? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 424: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Information Services Corporation: (1) For the year 2005, does 
management of the Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity 
within the Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 425: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Information Services Corporation: (1) For the year 2005, is management 
of the Crown aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the Crown, such as 
information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, 
what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 426: 
 
To the Minister of Industry and Resources: (1) For 2003/04, does management of the department/Crown 
have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the 
department/Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 427: 
 
To the Minister of Industry and Resources: (1) For 2004/05, does management of the department/Crown 
have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the 
department/Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 428: 
 
To the Minister of Industry and Resources: (1) For the current year, does management of the 
department/Crown have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within 
the department/Crown? (2) If so, what is the nature of this activity? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 429: 
 
To the Minister of Industry and Resources: (1) For the year 2005/06, who are the members of the 
Investment Attraction Council? (2) How many times has the Investment Attraction Council met? (3) 
What groups, organizations, and/or companies has the Investment Attraction Council met with? (4) What 
is the budget for the Investment Attraction Council? (5) How much has been spent by the Investment 
Attraction Council? (6) What are the results of the council’s work? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 430: 
 
To the Minister of Industry and Resources: (1) For the year 2004/05, who were the members of the 
Investment Attraction Council? (2) How many times did the Investment Attraction Council meet? (3) 
What groups, organizations, and/or companies did the Investment Attraction Council meet with? (4) What 
was the budget for the Investment Attraction Council? (5) How much was spent by the Investment 
Attraction Council? (6) What were the results of the council’s work? 
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Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 431: 
 
To the Minister of Industry and Resources: (1) For the year 2003/04, who were the members of the 
Investment Attraction Council? (2) How many times did the Investment Attraction Council meet? (3) 
What groups, organizations, and/or companies did the Investment Attraction Council meet with? (4) What 
was the budget for the Investment Attraction Council? (5) How much was spent by the Investment 
Attraction Council? (6) What were the results of the council’s work? 
 
Ms. Bakken Lackey, to ask the Government the following Question No. 432: 
 
To the Minister of Industry and Resources: (1) For the year 2002/03, who were the members of the 
Investment Attraction Council? (2) How many times did the Investment Attraction Council meet? (3) 
What groups, organizations, and/or companies did the Investment Attraction Council meet with? (4) What 
was the budget for the Investment Attraction Council? (5) How much was spent by the Investment 
Attraction Council? (6) What were the results of the council’s work? 
 
Mr. Hart, to ask the Government the following Question No. 433: 
 
To the Minister of Property Management: (1) Was the May 31, 2005 deadline for the receipts of 
proposals regarding disposal of the Echo Valley Conference Centre extended to a later date? (2) If so, 
what is the new deadline? (3) How many proposals were received and from whom? 
 
Mr. Hart, to ask the Government the following Question No. 434: 
 
To the Minister of Property Management: (1) How many proposals did SPM receive by the May 31, 2005 
deadline for the disposal of the Echo Valley Conference Centre? (2) Who were the parties that submitted 
proposals? 
 
The following Questions were given notice on day no. 4 and are to be answered by day no. 9: 
 
Mr. D'Autremont, to ask the Government the following Question No. 435: 
 
To the Minister of Justice: (1) For the fiscal year 2004/05, was management of the department aware of 
any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, for example, information received 
from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, what was the nature 
of this activity? 
 
Mr. D'Autremont, to ask the Government the following Question No. 436: 
 
To the Minister of Justice: (1) For the fiscal year 2004/05, did management of the department establish 
programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? (2) How did management 
monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Mr. D'Autremont, to ask the Government the following Question No. 437: 
 
To the Minister of Justice: For the fiscal year 2004/05, what did the department find as a result of the 
establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud in the 
department? 
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Mr. D'Autremont, to ask the Government the following Question No. 438: 
 
To the Minister of Justice: For the fiscal year 2004/05, did management of the department have any 
knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the department? (2) If so, what 
was the nature of this activity? 
 
Mr. D'Autremont, to ask the Government the following Question No. 439: 
 
To the Minister of Justice: (1) For the fiscal year 2003/04, did management of the department establish 
programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? (2) How did management 
monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Mr. D'Autremont, to ask the Government the following Question No. 440: 
 
To the Minister of Justice: For the fiscal year 2003/04, what did the department find as a result of the 
establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud in the 
department? 
 
Mr. D'Autremont, to ask the Government the following Question No. 441: 
 
To the Minister of Justice: (1) For the fiscal year 2003/04, was management of the department aware of 
any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, for example, information received 
from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, what was the nature 
of this activity? 
 
Mr. D'Autremont, to ask the Government the following Question No. 442: 
 
To the Minister of Justice: For the fiscal year 2003/04, did management of the department have any 
knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the department? (2) If so, what 
was the nature of this activity? 
 
Mr. D'Autremont, to ask the Government the following Question No. 443: 
  
To the Minister of Learning: (1) For the fiscal year 2003/04, was management of the department aware of 
any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, for example, information received 
from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, what was the nature 
of this activity? 
 
Mr. D'Autremont, to ask the Government the following Question No. 444: 
  
To the Minister of Learning: (1) For the fiscal year 2004/05, did management of the department establish 
programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? (2) How did management 
monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Mr. D'Autremont, to ask the Government the following Question No. 445: 
  
To the Minister of Learning: (1) For the fiscal year 2003/04, did management of the department establish 
programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? (2) How did management 
monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
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Mr. D'Autremont, to ask the Government the following Question No. 446: 
 
To the Minister of Learning: For the fiscal year 2003/04, what did the department find as a result of the 
establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud in the 
department? 
 
Mr. D'Autremont, to ask the Government the following Question No. 447: 
 
To the Minister of Learning: For the fiscal year 2003/04, did management of the department have any 
knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the department? (2) If so, what 
was the nature of this activity? 
 
Mr. D'Autremont, to ask the Government the following Question No. 448: 
 
To the Minister of Learning: For the fiscal year 2004/05, what did the department find as a result of the 
establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud in the 
department? 
 
Mr. D'Autremont, to ask the Government the following Question No. 449: 
 
To the Minister of Learning: For the fiscal year 2004/05, did management of the department have any 
knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the department? (2) If so, what 
was the nature of this activity? 
 
Mr. D'Autremont, to ask the Government the following Question No. 450: 
 
To the Minister of Learning: (1) For the fiscal year 2004/05, was management of the department aware of 
any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, for example, information received 
from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, what was the nature 
of this activity? 
 
Mr. D'Autremont, to ask the Government the following Question No. 451: 
 
To the Minister of Corrections and Public Safety: (1) For the fiscal year 2003/04, did management of the 
department establish programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? (2) 
How did management monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Mr. D'Autremont, to ask the Government the following Question No. 452: 
 
To the Minister of Corrections and Public Safety: (1) For the fiscal year 2004/05, was management of the 
department aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, for example, 
information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, 
what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Mr. D'Autremont, to ask the Government the following Question No. 453: 
 
To the Minister of Corrections and Public Safety: For the fiscal year 2004/05 what did the department 
find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud in the department? 
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Mr. D'Autremont, to ask the Government the following Question No. 454: 
 
To the Minister of Justice: (1) For the fiscal year 2003/04, did management of the department establish 
programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or detect fraud? (2) How did management 
monitor the above programs and/or controls? 
 
Mr. D'Autremont, to ask the Government the following Question No. 455: 
 
To the Minister of Corrections and Public Safety: For the fiscal year 2003/04, did management of the 
department have any knowledge of any actual or suspected fraud or other illegal activity within the 
department? (2) If so, what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Mr. D'Autremont, to ask the Government the following Question No. 456: 
 
To the Minister of Corrections and Public Safety: (1) For the fiscal year 2003/04, was management of the 
department aware of any allegations of fraud or other illegal activity within the department, for example, 
information received from employees, former employees, customers/clients, suppliers or others? (2) If so, 
what was the nature of this activity? 
 
Mr. D'Autremont, to ask the Government the following Question No. 457: 
 
To the Minister of Corrections and Public Safety: For the fiscal year 2003/04, what did the department 
find as a result of the establishment of programs and controls to mitigate fraud risks or to help prevent or 
detect fraud in the department? 
 
Ms. Draude, to ask the Government the following Question No. 458: 
 
To the Minister of First Nations and Métis Relations: (1) For the fiscal year 2000/01, what First Nations 
were under a boil water advisory? (2) How long were they under that advisory? 
 
Ms. Draude, to ask the Government the following Question No. 459: 
 
To the Minister of First Nations and Métis Relations: (1) For the fiscal year 2001/02, what First Nations 
were under a boil water advisory? (2) How long were they under that advisory? 
 
Ms. Draude, to ask the Government the following Question No. 460: 
 
To the Minister of First Nations and Métis Relations: (1) For the fiscal year 2002/03, what First Nations 
were under a boil water advisory? (2) How long were they under that advisory? 
 
Ms. Draude, to ask the Government the following Question No. 461: 
 
To the Minister of First Nations and Métis Relations: (1) For the fiscal year 2003/04, what First Nations 
were under a boil water advisory? (2) How long were they under that advisory? 
 
 
Ms. Draude, to ask the Government the following Question No. 462: 
 
To the Minister of First Nations and Métis Relations: (1) For the fiscal year 2004/05, what First Nations 
were under a boil water advisory? (2) How long were they under that advisory? 
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Ms. Draude, to ask the Government the following Question No. 463: 
 
To the Minister of First Nations and Métis Relations: (1) For the fiscal year 2005/06, what First Nations 
are under a boil water advisory? (2) How long have they been under that advisory? 
 
The following Questions were given notice on day no. 5 and are to be answered by day no. 10: 
 
Mr. Morgan, to ask the Government the following Question No. 464: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Information Services Corporation: (1) When will the new web-based 
program for the personal property registry be completed and operational? (2) Who is the software 
contractor? (3) How much is the total cost of development and implementation? 
 
Mr. Hermanson, to ask the Government the following Question No. 465: 
 
To the Premier: How much is the contract or contracts for the “Raise a Flag for Fairness” advertising 
campaign on equalization worth? 
 
Mr. Hermanson, to ask the Government the following Question No. 466: 
 
To the Premier: What company or companies have been contracted to produce the advertising for the 
“Raise a Flag for Fairness” advertising campaign on equalization? 
 
Mr. Hermanson, to ask the Government the following Question No. 467: 
 
To the Premier: From which department, Crown corporation, government agency or other source is the 
funding for the “Raise a Flag for Fairness” advertising campaign on equalization coming from? 
 
Mr. Hermanson, to ask the Government the following Question No. 468: 
 
To the Premier: When was the budget approved for the “Raise a Flag for Fairness” advertising campaign? 
 
Mr. Hermanson, to ask the Government the following Question No. 469: 
 
To the Premier: What is the total budget for the “Raise a Flag for Fairness” advertising campaign on 
equalization, including print, radio, online and television? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 470: 
 
To the Minister of Labour: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did the minister take in the 
period of April 4, 2004 to March 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 471: 
 
To the Minister of Learning: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did the minister take in the 
period of April 4, 2004 to March 31, 2005? 
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Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 472: 
 
To the Minister of Rural Development: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did the minister 
take in the period of April 4, 2004 to March 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 473: 
 
To the Minister of Health: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did the minister take in the 
period of April 4, 2004 to March 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 474: 
 
To the Minister of Finance: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did the minister take in the 
period of April 4, 2004 to March 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 475: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Public Service Commission: How many airplane trips on government 
aircraft did the minister take in the period of April 4, 2004 to March 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 476: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Crown Management Board: How many airplane trips on government 
aircraft did the minister take in the period of April 4, 2004 to March 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 477: 
 
To the Minister of First Nations and Métis Relations: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did 
the minister take in the period of April 4, 2004 to March 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 478: 
 
To the Minister of Culture, Youth and Recreation: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did 
the minister take in the period of April 4, 2004 to March 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 479: 
 
To the Minister of Northern Affairs: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did the minister take 
in the period of April 4, 2004 to March 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 480: 
 
To the Minister of Government Relations: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did the 
minister take in the period of April 4, 2004 to March 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 481: 
 
To the Minister of Community Resources and Employment: How many airplane trips on government 
aircraft did the minister take in the period of April 4, 2004 to March 31, 2005? 
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Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 482: 
 
To the Minister of Corrections and Public Safety: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did the 
minister take in the period of April 4, 2004 to March 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 483: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did the 
minister take in the period of April 4, 2004 to March 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 484: 
 
To the Minister of Environment: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did the minister take in 
the period of April 4, 2004 to March 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 485: 
 
To the Minister of Agriculture and Food: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did the 
minister take in the period of April 4, 2004 to March 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 486: 
 
To the Premier: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did the Premier take in the period of 
April 4, 2004 to March 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 487: 
 
To the Minister of Labour: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did the minister take in the 
period of April 1 to July 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 488: 
 
To the Minister of Learning: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did the minister take in the 
period of April 1 to July 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 489: 
 
To the Minister of Rural Development: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did the minister 
take in the period of April 1 to July 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 490: 
 
To the Minister of Health: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did the minister take in the 
period of April 1 to July 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 491: 
 
To the Minister of Finance: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did the minister take in the 
period of April 1 to July 31, 2005? 
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Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 492: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Public Service Commission: How many airplane trips on government 
aircraft did the minister take in the period of April 1 to July 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 493: 
 
To the Minister Responsible for Crown Management Board: How many airplane trips on government 
aircraft did the minister take in the period of April 1 to July 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 494: 
 
To the Minister of First Nations and Métis Relations: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did 
the minister take in the period of April 1 to July 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 495: 
 
To the Minister of Culture, Youth and Recreation: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did 
the minister take in the period of April 1 to July 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 496: 
 
To the Minister of Northern Affairs: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did the minister take 
in the period of April 1 to July 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 497: 
 
To the Minister of Government Relations: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did the 
minister take in the period of April 1 to July 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 498: 
 
To the Minister of Community Resources and Employment: How many airplane trips on government 
aircraft did the minister take in the period of April 1 to July 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 499: 
 
To the Minister of Corrections and Public Safety: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did the 
minister take in the period of April 1 to July 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 500: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did the 
minister take in the period of April 1 to July 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 501: 
 
To the Minister of Environment: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did the minister take in 
the period of April 1 to July 31, 2005? 
 



XLII  APPENDIX Tuesday, November 15, 2005 
 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 502: 
 
To the Minister of Agriculture and Food: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did the 
minister take in the period of April 1 to July 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 503: 
 
To the Premier: How many airplane trips on government aircraft did the Premier take in the period of 
April 1 to July 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Dearborn, to ask the Government the following Question No. 504: 
 
To the Minister of Agriculture and Food: Has the Department of Agriculture and Food requested an 
extension of the deadline for the Own Use Import program with the federal Pest Management Regulatory 
Agency? 
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 505: 
 
To the Minister of Industry and Resources: What was the total revenue the government of Saskatchewan 
received from tourism in 2000? 
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 506: 
 
To the Minister of Industry and Resources: What was the total revenue the government of Saskatchewan 
received from tourism in 2001? 
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 507: 
 
To the Minister of Industry and Resources: What was the total revenue the government of Saskatchewan 
received from tourism in 2002? 
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 508: 
 
To the Minister of Industry and Resources: What was the total revenue the government of Saskatchewan 
received from tourism in 2003? 
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 509: 
 
To the Minister of Industry and Resources: What was the total revenue the government of Saskatchewan 
received from tourism in 2004? 
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 510: 
 
To the Minister of Industry and Resources: To date, what is the total revenue the government of 
Saskatchewan has received from tourism in 2005? 
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 511: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: How many projects, and for what value and project 
location did the provincial government apply for under the Prairie Grain Roads program in the fiscal year 
2001/02? 
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Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 512: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: How many projects, and for what value and project 
location did the provincial government apply for under the Prairie Grain Roads program in the fiscal year 
2002/03? 
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 513: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: How many projects, and for what value and project 
location did the provincial government apply for under the Prairie Grain Roads program in the fiscal year 
2003/04? 
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 514: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: How many projects, and for what value and project 
location did the provincial government apply for under the Prairie Grain Roads program in the fiscal year 
2004/05? 
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 515: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: To date, for the fiscal year 2005/06, how many projects, 
and for what value and project location did the provincial government apply for under the Prairie Grain 
Roads program? 
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 516: 
 
To the Minister of Immigration: For the fiscal year 1999/2000, what was the average processing time, in 
days, for each application category of the immigration program (i.e. skilled workers, business persons, 
farmers and students) for a nominee from the point he/she applied through the program to the point he/she 
was considered nominated? 
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 517: 
 
To the Minister of Immigration: For the fiscal year 2000/01, what was the average processing time, in 
days, for each application category of the immigration program (i.e. skilled workers, business persons, 
farmers and students) for a nominee from the point he/she applied through the program to the point he/she 
was considered nominated? 
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 518: 
 
To the Minister of Immigration: For the fiscal year 2001/02, what was the average processing time, in 
days, for each application category of the immigration program (i.e. skilled workers, business persons, 
farmers and students) for a nominee from the point he/she applied through the program to the point he/she 
was considered nominated? 
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 519: 
 
To the Minister of Immigration: For the fiscal year 2002/03, what was the average processing time, in 
days, for each application category of the immigration program (i.e. skilled workers, business persons, 
farmers and students) for a nominee from the point he/she applied through the program to the point he/she 
was considered nominated? 
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Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 520: 
 
To the Minister of Immigration: For the fiscal year 2003/04, what was the average processing time, in 
days, for each application category of the immigration program (i.e. skilled workers, business persons, 
farmers and students) for a nominee from the point he/she applied through the program to the point he/she 
was considered nominated? 
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 521: 
 
To the Minister of Immigration: For the fiscal year 2004/05, what was the average processing time, in 
days, for each application category of the immigration program (i.e. skilled workers, business persons, 
farmers and students) for a nominee from the point he/she applied through the program to the point he/she 
was considered nominated? 
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 522: 
 
To the Minister of Immigration: To date, for the fiscal year 2005/06, what is the average processing time, 
in days, for each application category of the immigration program (i.e. skilled workers, business persons, 
farmers and students) for a nominee from the point he/she applies through the program to the point he/she 
is considered nominated? 
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 523: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: How many kilometres of road were paved and/or 
reconstructed (breakdown for each) in the fiscal year 2002/03?  
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 524: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: How many kilometres of road were paved and/or 
reconstructed (breakdown for each) in the fiscal year 2003/04?  
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 525: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: How many kilometres of road were paved and/or 
reconstructed (breakdown for each) in the fiscal year 2004/05?  
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 526: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: How many kilometres of road were paved and/or 
reconstructed (breakdown for each) in the fiscal year 2005/06?  
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 527: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: For the fiscal year 2000/01, how much did the 
government spend on Highway 1 construction and maintenance from the Manitoba border to the Alberta 
border? 
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Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 528: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: For the fiscal year 2001/02, how much did the 
government spend on Highway 1 construction and maintenance from the Manitoba border to the Alberta 
border? 
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 529: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: For the fiscal year 2002/03, how much did the 
government spend on Highway 1 construction and maintenance from the Manitoba border to the Alberta 
border? 
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 530: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: For the fiscal year 2003/04, how much did the 
government spend on Highway 1 construction and maintenance from the Manitoba border to the Alberta 
border? 
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 531: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: For the fiscal year 2004/05, how much did the 
government spend on Highway 1 construction and maintenance from the Manitoba border to the Alberta 
border? 
 
Mr. Weekes, to ask the Government the following Question No. 532: 
 
To the Minister of Highways and Transportation: To date, for the fiscal year 2005/06, how much has the 
government spent on Highway 1 construction and maintenance from the Manitoba border to the Alberta 
border? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 533: 
 
To the Minister of Property Management: (1) When was final approval given for a new airport terminal in 
Regina? (2) When was the tender posted? (3) What is the expected completion date for the project? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 534: 
 
To the Minister of Property Management: (1) On what date was the last occupational health and safety 
inspection done on the government airport hangar? (2) What were the findings of this inspection? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 535: 
 
To the Minister of Property Management: (1) Are there currently occupational health and safety problems 
in the temporary trailers used at the government airport terminal? (2) If so, what are they and are 
corrective measures being taken? 
 
Mr. Huyghebaert, to ask the Government the following Question No. 536: 
 
To the Minister of Property Management: (1) On what date was the mould problem corrected in the 
government airport hangar? (2) Was this problem corrected in the office space in the hangar as well? 
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Ms Draude, to ask the Government the following Question No. 537: 
 
To the Minister of Culture, Youth and Recreation: What Centennial events funded by the province from 
March 31, 2004 to March 31, 2005 involved a tender for the contract to provide goods and/or services for 
the event? 
 
Ms Draude, to ask the Government the following Question No. 538: 
 
To the Minister of Culture, Youth and Recreation: What Centennial events funded by the province from 
March 31, 2003 to March 31, 2004 involved a tender for the contract to provide goods and/or services for 
the event? 
 
Ms Draude, to ask the Government the following Question No. 539: 
 
To the Minister of Culture, Youth and Recreation: (1) What Centennial events were funded by the 
department from March 31, 2004 to March 31, 2005? (2) Which departmental program funded these 
events? 
 
Ms Draude, to ask the Government the following Question No. 540: 
 
To the Minister of Culture, Youth and Recreation: (1) What Centennial events were funded by the 
department from March 31, 2003 to March 31, 2004? (2) Which departmental program funded these 
events? 
 
Ms Draude, to ask the Government the following Question No. 541: 
 
To the Minister of Culture, Youth and Recreation: (1) What Centennial events have been funded by the 
department from April 1, 2005 to the present? (2) Which departmental program funded these events? 
 
Ms Draude, to ask the Government the following Question No. 542: 
 
To the Minister of Culture, Youth and Recreation: What Centennial events funded by the province from 
April 1, 2005 to the present involved a tender for the contract to provide goods and/or services for the 
event? 
 
The following Questions were given notice on day no. 6 and are to be answered by day no. 11: 
 
Mr. Brkich, to ask the Government the following Question No. 543: 
 
To the Minister of Health: What were the criteria for accessing the individualized funding program in the 
Heartland Health Region from March 31, 2005 to the present? 
 
Mr. Brkich, to ask the Government the following Question No. 544: 
 
To the Minister of Health: What were the criteria for accessing the individualized funding program in the 
Heartland Health Region from March 31, 2004 to March 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Brkich, to ask the Government the following Question No. 545: 
 
To the Minister of Health: What were the criteria for accessing the individualized funding program in the 
Heartland Health Region from March 31, 2003 to March 31, 2004? 
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Mr. Brkich, to ask the Government the following Question No. 546: 
 
To the Minister of Health: How many clients accessed the individualized funding program in the 
Heartland Health Region from March 31, 2005 to the present? 
 
Mr. Brkich, to ask the Government the following Question No. 547: 
 
To the Minister of Health: How many clients accessed the individualized funding program in the 
Heartland Health Region from March 31, 2004 to March 31, 2005? 
 
Mr. Brkich, to ask the Government the following Question No. 548: 
 
To the Minister of Health: How many clients accessed the individualized funding program in the 
Heartland Health Region from March 31, 2003 to March 31, 2004? 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

NOTICE REGARDING PETITIONS FOR PRIVATE BILLS 
 
Notice is hereby given, in accordance with Rules 75 and 78 of the Legislative Assembly of 
Saskatchewan, that the time for filing Petitions for Private Bills with the Clerk of the Legislative 
Assembly will expire on the twentieth sitting day, and that the time for presenting Petitions for Private 
Bills to the Legislative Assembly at its present Session will expire on the twenty-fifth sitting day of the 
said Session. 
 
 GWENN RONYK 
 Clerk of the Legislative Assembly 
 
 




